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Main Conference

Welcome

153. Future of Open Standards

154. South Tyrol: The Dolomites, Apples, Wine and Free Software

Break

49. What is ODF-Next?

Lunch Break

Break

19:30- Town Visit and Dinner

Key: ODF Community Developer Italian / English

OOo and FLOSS in 
Education

09:00-
09:15
09:15-
09:45

152. Some methodological considerations on migrating a medium size Municipality to 
OpenOffice.org

09:45-
10:15
10:15-
10:45

Centro studi
Palazzo dei Sette -

Governatore
Palazzo del Popolo - Sala 

Etrusca
Palazzo del Popolo - Sala 

dei 400

11:15-
12:00

112. OpenDocument 
(ODF): Living Open 

Standards

46. City of Roedovre, 
Denmark - the strategy

115. The State of the 
Project: OpenOffice.org 

2009

151. Importance of 
independent certification 

computer skill 
programmes: ECDL with 

Ope

12:15-
13:00

90. Project Renaissance - 
Designing a new user 

interface for 
OpenOffice.org

54. Present the 
OpenOffice.org 

Education Project, and its 
role inside 

OpenOffice.org

14:00-
14:45

72. Delivering the 
promise of ODF 
interoperability

110. Contributing to 
OpenOffice.org as a 

company

99. New Features and 
Future Development in 

Calc and Chart

14. OpenOffice.org 
Certification Project

15:00-
15:45

67. OpenOffice.org 
Interoperability with 

Microsoft Office through 
ODF

138. Deploying OO.org in 
small and large 

companies

129. What's cooking in 
the Writer project?

145. A sustainable model 
for high quality open-

source training

16:15-
17:00

66. ODF/UOF 
Interop:Lessons Learned 

in RedOffice

97. OpenOffice.org on 
netbooks

94. Improvements to the 
OOo release engineering 

process

11. OpenOffice.org in the 
Italian Vocational 

Training of South Tyrol

17:15-
18:00

117. Interoperability best 
practices in Symphony 

development

80. OpenOffice.org 
Portable - Take your 

office with you

103. Installation and 
Packaging in Presence 

and Future

68. Free Software 
diffusion in an 

university : Five year 
experiment

18:15-
19:00

79. Panel Session: The 
State of ODF

4. Introducing the 
OpenOfficeMouse

130. Split OpenOffice.org 
build

146. FLOSS Philosophy 
and Digital Citizenship
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Main Conference OOo Development

Break

Lunch Break

Break

124. QA-Camp

21. Extension Localization

Party

Key:
Developer Documentation Italian / English

ODF QA QA Native Lang

Centro studi Palazzo dei Sette -
Governatore Palazzo dei Sette - Capriati Palazzo del Popolo - Sala 

Etrusca
Palazzo del Popolo - Sala 

dei 400

09:00- 
09:45

28. Achievement and 
challenges in Calc

22. "Normal" office suite in 
terms of the ordinary user

23. OpenOffice.org, 
Windows and startup 
performance - past, 
present and future

35. Documenting 
OpenOffice.org

147. OpenOffice.org 
Macros & Extensions

10:00- 
10:45

60. An Approach to Solve 
Occasional Memory 
Corruption Problem

108. Apply Persona in 
Design and Development

102. I'm Waiting for My 
App (to start up)

69. The ways to get 
documentation in the 

future

11:15- 
12:00

15. ODFKit: The common 
ODF processing library

109. Getting 
usagetracking data, 

technical and security 
aspects and a look in the 

fut

37. Using Benchmark 
System to Trace 
OpenOffice.org 
Performance

127. How Many Languages 
Does OpenOffice.org 

Speak?

12:15- 
13:00

18. LPOD, a library to 
extend ODF ecosystem

39. Insight into 
RedOffice4.5 - Exploring 

Its Future

98. Performance 
Improvements in Calc

63. OOo translation - Best 
practices

14:00- 
14:45

126. ODF on the Server: 
ODFDOM - Present, Past 

and Future

85. User Experience 
Overview of IBM Lotus 

Symphony

38. Performance of XML-
based format processing

76. Associazione PLIO: the 
state of the Italian Native 

Language Project

148. Extending 
OpenOffice.org with Java

15:00- 
15:45

82. The ODF Template 
Engine : An easy 

document generation tool 
built with ODFDOM

140. The SZOMIN08 
project: Source Code 
Quality Analysis of 

OpenOffice.org

83. Performance Story of 
Lotus Symphony

61. What are the 
Brazilians doing?

16:15- 
17:00

96. Exposing ODF data to 
web-based mashups

93. UX Workshop I - The 
role and the methods of 

user experience in  
product design

89. How to keep 
translated OpenOffice.org 
documents up-to-date the 

easy way

17:15- 
18:00

30. OpenOffice.org can 
speak using odt2daisy ! 92. UX Workshop II - User 

Experience Done "Live" 
Based on Expertise and  

Usage Data

156. BoF – ODF Toolkits – 
programming anywhere

18:15-
19:00

131. The pragmatic 
approach to OOXML

20:00-
23:55

Dev - UX Dev - Performance
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Main Conference

55. OOo4Kids : the story

Break

48. Elexis and OpenOffice

Lunch Break

Closing Session

Key:
Features Extending OOo Native Lang Features Italian / English

Community Extending OOo Developer

OOo and FLOSS in 
Education

Centro studi
Palazzo dei Sette -

Governatore
Palazzo dei Sette - Capriati

Palazzo del Popolo - Sala 
Etrusca

Palazzo del Popolo - Sala 
dei 400

09:00- 
09:45

34. Intelligent Group On 
Impress

155. A new logo for 
OpenOffice.org

100. Refine Mutilingual 
Support with ICU

24. Discussion on a 
possible future 
architecture for 
OpenOffice.org

142. Results of the GSoC 
2009 term

10:00- 
10:45

143. Code your own 3D 
transition

2. Building Office 
Automation and Office 

Innovation through 
Extensions

86. What’s new in spell 
checker, hyphenation and 
thesaurus development?

107. Lists and Outline in 
Writer

11:15- 
12:00

157. Marketing OOo in 
2010 78. Extending 

LanguageTool, a style and 
grammar checker

16. VBA Where we are and 
where we are going

150. European Open 
Source Competence Centre

12:15- 
13:00

120. SymphonyNext 
Overview

122. IBM Lotus Symphony 
programmability story

119. OOEclipse is now 
talking C++

14:00- 
14:45

51. Case study: A 
document contents/styles 
checking solution base on 

Lotus Symphony

44. Integrating OpenOffice 
in case and document 

handling system in city of 
Roedovre,

132. Write your C++ 
extensions the smart way

149. Community Council 
Q&A Session

15:00-
15:30
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